
Sunday,  May 3rd                      (I took time to pray today  )  
 
Read:  John 10:1-10   This Scripture is the one where Jesus  
talks about sheep and how they only listen to the shepherd’s 
voice.  He also related this to how He is the way to salvation. 
 
Questions:   How well do you do at recognizing Jesus’ voice? 
How well do you accept and understand that Jesus is the way to 
salvation? 
 
Monday, May 4th                        (I took time to pray today  
 
Read:   Acts 2:42-47  This is the story in Acts of how there was 
fellowship of the believers after the Holy Spirit came down to 
them.  It shares how they lived with one another. 
  
Questions:  Would you struggle with having all that you have be 
in common with others?  Would you struggle with selling all your 
possessions so that you could give to anyone who had need? 
 
Tuesday, May 5th                        (I took time to pray today  )  
 
Read:   Psalm 23:1  “The Lord is my shepherd, I lack nothing.” 
 
Questions:   Sure, this is a simple statement, but how do you 
respond when you feel you have lost everything?   Do you trust 
Jesus or are you filled with worry and fear? 
 
Wednesday, May 6th                  (I took time to pray today  
                                 
Read:   1 Peter 2:19-25  A reminder of what Jesus endured.  
But also a comment of how we would handle being punished for 
something we did not do. 
 
Questions:    Is it hard for you to be accused and then punished 
for something that you did not do?  How do you handle that?  As 
we learn about sheep and shepherds, how does it make you feel 
knowing that Christ’s death allowed us to return to the Shep-
herd?  

Thursday, May 7th                  (I took time to pray today  )  
                                    
Read:   John 14:6   “Jesus answered, ‘I am the way and the 
truth and the life.  No one comes to the Father except through 
me.’” 
 
Questions:   Do you see that it is important to have a relation-
ship with Jesus  in order to get to the Father?   At this point, can 
You distinguish between God as Father, God as Son, God as 
Holy Spirit?  Can you explain this to another? 
 
Friday, May 8th                        (I took time to pray today  ) 
  
Read:  Romans 10:9  “If you declare with your mouth, ‘Jesus is 
Lord,’ and believe in your heart that God raised him from the 
dead, you will be saved.” 
 
Questions:  Again, do you see the importance of having a rela-
tionship with Jesus?  Are you one who only prays to God and not 
to Jesus?   
 
Saturday, May 9th                      (I took time to pray today  
 
Read:    1 Timothy 2:5  ”For there is one God and one mediator 
between God and mankind, the man Christ Jesus,….’” 
 
Questions:   Do you see that Jesus is the mediator between you 
and God?  Does this change things in how you relate to God?  
Does this make you less afraid of God, knowing you can go 
through Jesus to get to Him? 
 
 
    ~~~~~~~~ 
 
 
Through God’s love for us we can’t help but want to serve  
others and show that love to them.  Let us help you explore the 
best way for you to  show love and serve in your Christian path.  
See Pastor Bob or  Deacon Maryanne  who are willing to help 
you in your  faith walk. 
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Prayers For The Week 
 

Sunday:  Lord, thank you for Jesus and that He is the way to our sal-

vation.  Give me greater understanding of this if I do not completely 

understand.  Amen. 

 

Monday:  God, this story in Acts is a view of how the church lived to-

gether.  Help us to be the church for each other and for our  

community.  Amen.   

 

Tuesday:   Lord, thank You that through You I lack nothing.  Help me 

to trust You with this when I feel I am lacking.  Amen.  

 

Wednesday:  Jesus, thank you for how You suffered on the cross.  

You continue to teach me more and more about what it meant for my 

life.  Continue to reveal to me more about You.  Amen.     

 

Thursday:  Jesus, You are the way to the Father.  Thank You for 

that.  Help me to better understand what that means in my life.  

Amen. 

 

Friday:  Jesus,  draw me closer to You so that I can boldly proclaim 

that You are Lord.  Thank You for Your saving grace.  Amen. 

 

Saturday:  Father, thank you for Your Son who will mediate all things 

between me and You.  He will bring my sin to You in a way that I can 

fill Your forgiveness.  Help me to trust Him with this on a daily basis.  

Amen. 
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Bring a friend to Sunday School and  

worship on Sunday!   
Check in on Facebook when you are here.   

     I am the Gatekeeper 


