
Sunday,  June 21st                     (I took time to pray today )  
 
Read:  Matthew 10:24-25  “The student is not above the teach-
er, nor a servant above his master.  It is enough for students to 
be like their teachers, and servants like their masters.  If the 
head of the house has been called Beelzebul, how much more 
the members of his household!” 
 
Questions:   What is Jesus referring to in these verses?  Are we 
expected to suffer like Jesus?  How do you feel about this? 
 
Monday, June 22nd                    (I took time to pray today  
 
Read:   Matthew 10:26-37   This Scripture gives more instruc-
tions by Jesus.  One that stuck out for me was that we should  
not be afraid of those who kill the body but the one who can de-
stroy both soul and body. 
 
Questions:   Who can destroy both soul and body?  Are we do-
ing everything we can to avoid being swayed by him? 
 
Tuesday, June 23rd                    (I took time to pray today )  
 
Read:    Genesis 21:8-21  This is the story of Sarah wanting to 
send the slave girl, that Abraham had a child with, away. 
 
Questions:   Do you see God’s protection even when Hagar 
gave up?  Why do you struggle trusting God in difficult situa-
tions? 
 
Wednesday, June 24th              (I took time to pray today  
                                 
Read:   Psalm 86:1-10  This Psalm talks about the trust that Da-
vid had and asking God to hear his prayer.. 
 
Questions:   When you pray do you also talk about all the things 
that God has done and can do?  Do you think this is an im-
portant part of your prayer life?  If so, what will you do about it? 

Thursday, June 25th                    (I took time to pray today  
                                    
Read:  Psalm 86:16-17  “Turn to me and have mercy on me; 
show your strength in behalf of your servant; save me, because I 
serve you just as my Mother did.  Give me a sign of your good-
ness, that my enemies may see it and be put to shame, for you, 
Lord, have helped me and comforted me.” 
  
Questions:   Have you ever asked God for a sign?  If not, do 
you believe He will respond to you asking Him for a sign? 
 
Friday, June 26th                          (I took time to pray today  
  
Read:  Romans 6:1b-11  This part of Romans talks about us 
being dead to sin but alive in Christ. 
 
Questions:   How do you feel knowing that we should no longer 
be slaves to sin?  How do you feel knowing that we can be set 
free from sin? 
 
Saturday, June 27th                     (I took time to pray today  
 
Read:  Acts 2:36  “Therefore let all Israel be assured of this:  
God has made this Jesus whom you crucified, both Lord and 
Messiah.”   
 
Questions:  Do you recognize that Jesus is both Lord and 
anointed Savior?   Are you assured of this?  What does this 
mean for your life? 
 
 
 
    ~~~~~~~~ 
 
Through God’s love for us we can’t help but want to serve  
others and show that love to them.  Let us help you explore the 
best way for you to  show love and serve in your Christian path.  
See Pastor Bob or  Deacon Maryanne  who are willing to help 
you in your  faith walk. 
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Prayers For The Week 
 

Sunday:  Jesus,  I know that just because we have a relationship 

with You, that we are not going to suffer.  I pray I may look at how 

You handled suffering and act accordingly.  Amen. 

 

Monday:  Lord, protect me from the enemy.  Help me to discern 

when he is trying to destroy me.  Amen.   

 

Tuesday:   God, today’s Scripture is a good reminder of how You 

protected others in the Bible.  Imprint that on my heart so that it will 

help me to trust You more.  Amen.  

 

Wednesday:  Jesus, remind me to show my gratitude and praise in 

my prayer times because You have done great things in my life.  

Amen.     

 

Thursday:  Lord God, Thank You for Your mercy, for Your help and 

comfort.  Give me a sign of Your goodness so that my enemies may 

see it and be put to shame.  Amen. 

 

Friday:  God, thank You for Your love for us and sending Your Son.  

Thank You that we are set free from sin because of the cross and no 

longer have to be slaves to our sin.  Amen. 

 

Saturday:  Jesus, help me to be assured that You are my Lord and 

also my Savior.  Continue to reveal Yourself and Your truths to me.  

Amen. 

   

  

June 21, 2020 

Grow,  
  Pray,  

 and  
Study Guide.  

 
Bring a friend to Sunday School and  

worship on Sunday!   
Check in on Facebook when you are here.   

        Who’s in Charge 


